THE LONDON GAZETTE FRIDAY 22 MARCH 2002 3623
Commencement, citation and interpretation Standard Service parcel to Zone 5
1.—(1) This Scheme shall come into operation on 2 April 2002 and may dine 0 5ke i oht: 490
be cited as the Consignia plc Inland Parcel Post (Amendment No 3) Iel;)ctﬁﬁmlgfal'g 5g1<1gno‘fi;§rttb £ 0.5kg in weight up :
Scheme 2002. : :
(2) This Scheme shall be read as one with the Successor Postal Services to ZhSIEi%it 10,5k L of 0.5ke above 2.5k 1.05
Company Inland Parcel Post Scheme 2001© (hereinafter called “the cac ?h ttionat o. d golr gﬁir Ok : g above =.oKg
Scheme”) as amended by the Consignia plc Inland Parcel Post n “}’le}% dttup tol %HSklnc u mtg Sf (%.Sk above Ske i 0.90
(Amendment No 1) Scheme 2001® and the Consignia plc Inland Parcel cach additional ¥.0Xg or part of U.okg above Skg 1
Post (Amendment No 2) Scheme 2001©- weight up to and including 10kg: . 0.55
. each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 10kg in
Postal Facilities weight up to and including 15kg: ) 0.65
2. Inparagraph 3A(1)(a) of Schedule 3 to the Scheme (Postal facilities), each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 15kg in
for “£70.00 per annum” there shall be substituted “£75 per annum”. weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg: 0.45
@ Consignia plc (a Company registered in England and Wales under Standard Service parcel to Zones 6 and 7
number 4138203) is a universal service provider as defined in section . . S
4(3)(a) of the Postal Services Act 2000. Consignia plc is the successor g)cthe z‘é?i(tiilgr%a?'glggkmo‘;velg?ttbf0 Ske in weight u 14.30
postal services Company referred toin article 37(1) of the Postal Services {0 2.5kg: -~Kgorp K8 ght up 1.35
Act 2000 (Commencement No. 4 and Transitional and Savings T ’
S each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 2.5kg
o Soions) Order 2001 (00171148 (C.37)). inweight up to and including Ske: . 0.95
©The Post Office Inland Parcel Post Scheme 1989 was amended, S\?ecih}?td L?ltlt%n:rllc(l).i?llgléu(ziri r{) arltO(l)(fQ.Skg above Skg in 0.85
renamed the Successor Postal Services Company Inland Parcel Post eacl% ad dli)tional 0.5ke or gart ofgb 5ke above 10ke in ’
Scheme 2001 and treated as made under section 89 of the Postal Services weight up to and .inclgu dig) 15ke: ke g 055
Act 2000 by article 38 of the Postal Services Act 2000 (Commencement eacﬁ ad dli)tional 0.5ke or gart O%g(.) Ske above 15ke in ’
No 4 and Transitional and Savings Provisions) Order 2001 (2001/1148 weight in excess of 1 Sgkg 111)p to 20kg‘ g g 035
(C. 37)). ’ ’
@ London Gazette 29/6/2001, issue number 56259. Standard Service parcel to Zone 8
(3)' London Gazette 6/7{2001, issue number 56266. o not exceeding 0.5kg in weight: 14.65
Signed by Louise Rolfe, for and on behalf of Consignia plc each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg in weight up
6 March 2002. (1008) to 2.5kg: 1.35
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 2.5kg
in weight up to and including Skg: 0.95
(B each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 5kg in
ConSIg nia p le weight up to and including 10kg: 0.85
CONSIGNIA PLC SCHEME OP 2/2002 each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 10kg in
[This Note is not part of the Scheme] Weiﬁhtd‘éPtFO a‘il% i;’lf(ﬂUding ltSkfgé) Sk ab 15ke 1 0.55
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above in
Note. The Scheme which follows this Note is made under section 89 of weight in excess of lgkg Ep to 20kg: & & 0.35
the Postal Services Act 2000 and amends the Successor Postal Services . ’ '
Company Overseas Parcel Post Scheme 2001. The Scheme, which comes Standard Service parcel to Zone 9
into force on 2 April 2002 revises certain postal charges. not exceeding 0.5kg in weight: . . 15.80
CONSIGNIA PLC OVERSEAS PARCEL POST (AMENDMENT each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg in weight up
NO 4) SCHEME 2002 to 2.5kg: 2.00
MAGE oo 6 March 2002 cach additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 2.5kg
I ) R in weight up to and including Skg: 1.80
Coming into OPEration ........covevveiveiinisisie, 2 April 2002 each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 5kg in
Consignia plc® by virtue of the powers conferred upon it by section 89 weight up to and including 10kg: ) 1.30
of the Postal Services Act 2000® and of all other powers enabling it in each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 10kg in
this behalf, hereby makes the following Scheme: weight up to and including 15kg: ) 1.00
Commencement and citation each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 15kg in
. ) ) ) weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg: 0.75
1.—(1) This Scheme shall come into operation on 2 April 2002 and may .
be cited as the Consignia plc Overseas Parcel Post (Amendment No 4) Economy Service parcel to Zone 9
Scheme 2002. not exceeding 0.5kg in weight: 13.50
(2) This Scheme shall be read as one with the Successor Postal Services each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg in weight up
Company Inland OverseasParcel Post Scheme 2001 (hereinafter called to 2.5kg: 1.45
“the Scheme”), as amended by the Consignia plc Overseas Parcel Post each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 2.5kg
(Amendment No. 1) Scheme 2001, the Consignia plc Overseas Parcel in weight up to and including Skg: 1.25
Post (Amendment No 2) Scheme 2001 and the Consignia plc Overseas each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 5kg in
Parcel Post (Amendment No 3) Scheme 20020. weight up to and including 10kg: 1.15
Fees for customs clearance each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 10kg in
weight up to and including 15kg: 1.05
fzi. In ?‘;r;ggipflf Of}tlh(fl icherrtl)e ('Feesdﬁ%rflzlgio ms clearance), for the each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 15kg in
gure "£6.257 there shall be substitute e weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg: 0.90
Rates of postage ) ) Standard Service parcel to Zone 10
3. There shall be substituted the following for Part 1 of Schedule 1 to . . .
the Scheme: not exceeding 0.5kg in weight: 13.40
« ' each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg in weight up
PART 1 to 2.5kg: 3.35
. each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 2.5kg
1 Standard Service parcel to Zone 4 in weight up to and including Skg: . 3.20
not exceeding 1kg in weight: 3.80 cach additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 5kg in
exceeding 1kg but not exceeding 2kg in weight: 4.75 weight up to and including 10kg: ) 2.60
exceeding 2kg but not exceeding 4kg in weight: 7.20 cach additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 10kg in
exceeding 4kg but not exceeding 6kg in weight: 7.80 weight up to and including 15kg: ) 1.95
exceeding 6kg but not exceeding 8kg in weight: 8.95 each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 15kg in
exceeding 8kg but not exceeding 10kg in weight: 9.60 weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg: 1.55

exceeding 10kg but not exceeding 20kg in weight: 11.15




3624 THELONDON GAZETTE FRIDAY 22 MARCH 2002

8 Economy Service parcel to Zone 10

not exceeding 0.5kg in weight: 12.15

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgin weight up

to 2.5kg: 2.20

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 2.5kg

in weight up to and including Skg: 1.90

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 5kg in

weight up to and including 10kg: 1.85

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 10kg in

weight up to and including 15kg: 1.70

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 15kg in

weight in excess of 15kgup to 20kg: 1.65
9 Standard Service parcel to Zone 11

not exceeding 0.5kg in weight: 18.40

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgin weight up

to 2.5kg: 3.35

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 2.5kg

in weight up to and including Skg: 2.95

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 5kg in

weight up to and including 10kg: 2.40

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 10kg in

weight up to and including 15kg: 2.45

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg above 15kg in

weight in excess of 15kgup to 20kg: 2.30
10 Economy Service parcel to Zone 11

not exceeding 0.5kg in weight: 16.80

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgin weight up

to 2.5kg: 2.75

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 2.5kg

in weight up to and including Skg: 2.25

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 5kg in

weight up to and including 10kg: 2.05

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 10kg in

weight up to and including 15kg: 1.90

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 15kg in

weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg: 1.75
11 Standard Service parcel to Zone 12

not exceeding 0.5kg in weight: 18.50

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgin weight up

to 2.5kg: 4.40

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 2.5kg

in weight up to and including Skg: 4.20

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 5kg in

weight up to and including 10kg: 3.85

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 10kg in

weight up to and including 15kg: 3.25

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 15kg in

weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg: 2.85
12 Economy Service parcel to Zone 12

not exceeding 0.5kg in weight: 13.15

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgin weight up

to 2.5kg: 2.00

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 2.5kg

in weight up to and including Skg: 2.00

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove Skg in

weight up to and including 10kg: 1.75

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 10kg in

weight up to and including 15kg: 1.80

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kgabove 15kg in

weight in excess of 15kgup to 20kg: 1.80”

Parcel Compensation Fee
In Column I in Part 1 of Schedule 3 to the Scheme—

“(a) for “£1” there shall be substituted “£1.25”;
(b) for “£2” there shall be substituted “£2.50”.

@ Consignia plc (a Company registered in England and Wales under
number 4138203) is a universal service provider as defined in section
4(3)(a) of the Postal Services Act 2000.

® 2000 c. 26.

© The Post Office Overseas Parcel Post Scheme 1982 was amended,
renamed the Successor Postal Services Company Overseas Parcel Post
Scheme 2001 and treated as made under section 89 of the Postal Services
Act 2000 by article 41 of the Postal Services Act 2000 (Commencement
No 4 and Transitional and Savings Provisions) Order 2001 (2001/1148
(C.37)).

@ London Gazette 29/6/2001, issue number 56259.

© London Gazette 6/7/2001, issue number 56266.

O London Gazette 21/12/2001, issue number 56424.

Signed by Louise Rolfe, for and on behalf of Consignia plc

6 March 2002. (1009)

Telecommunications
OFTEL

NOTICE UNDER SECTION 12(6A) OF THE
TELECOMMUNICATIONS ACT 1984

MODIFICATION TO ALL PUBLIC TELECOMMUNICATIONS
OPERATOR LICENCES

1. During the period beginning on 22 June 1984 and ending on 18
January 2002, the Secretary of State granted licences under section 7 of
the Telecommunications Act 1984 (the “Act”) to particular persons
which the Secretary of State has designated by order under section 9 of
the Act as having public telecommunications systems, collectively
referred to hereinafter as the “PTO licences”.

2. On 18 March 2002, theDirector General of Telecommunications(the
“Director”), in exercise of the powersconferred on him by section 12 of
the Act, made the following modification to Condition 17in Schedule 1
of the PTO licences:

The words ‘in writing’ in Condition 17.2 were deleted.

3. In accordance with section 12(6A) of the Act the Director hereby
gives notice that his reason for making the modification was to enable
the development and launch of new products and services using
automaticcalling equipment. Theretention of the requirementto obtain
consent ensures that consumers remain adequately protected. However,
the removal of the requirement for this consent to be obtained in writing
allows more products and services to be provided and consumers will be
able to benefit from automated services should they wish to. The
modification is deregulatory and in line with Oftel’s long-term strategy
of ensuring that regulationis kept to the minimum necessary to obtain
the appropriate outcome. (851)

OFTEL

NOTICE UNDER SECTION 12(2) OF THE
TELECOMMUNICATIONS ACT 1984

PROPOSED MODIFICATION TO THE LICENCES OF
EARTHADVICE LTD, EUROCALL LTD, FIBRENET UK LTD
AND AT&T GLOBAL NETWORK SERVICES (UK) B.V.

1. The Director General of Telecommunications (the “Director”) in
accordance with section 12(2) of the Telecommunications Act 1984 as
amended by the Electronic Communications Act 2000 (the “Act”)
hereby gives notice that he proposes to make a modification to the
licence granted to Earthadvice Ltd on 29 January 2002, the licence
granted to Eurocall Ltd on 13 March 2002, the licence granted to
Fibrenet UK Ltd on 13 March 2002 and the licence granted to AT&T
Global Network Services (UK) B.V. on 15 March 2002, by the Secretary
of State for Trade and Industry under section 7 of the Act, collectively
referred to hereinafter as the “licences”.

2. Boththe effect of and the reason for the proposed modification are
set out in the Schedule below. They have been detailed in full in the
Consultation Document of June 2001 entitled ‘Use of automatic calling
equipment review’. The full text of the proposed modification is set out
in Annex B to Oftel’s Statement of January 2002. Both documents are
available through the Oftel website at www.oftel.gov.uk.

3. The same modification was made on 18 March 2002 to all licences
granted during the period beginning on 22 June 1984 and ending on 18
January 2002 under section 7 of the Act to particular persons which the
Secretary of State has designated by order under section 9 of the Act as
having public telecommunications systems. The notice for this
modification was published on 18 January 2002 in accordance with
section 12(2) of the Act. The proposed modification will bring the
licences into line with those licences already modified.

4. Section 12A(7) of the Act provides that a modification is
deregulatory if:

(a) the effect of the conditions to be modified is to impose a burden
affecting the holder of the licence in which those conditions areincluded;
(b) the modification would remove or reduce the burden without
removing any necessary protection; and

(c) the modification is such that no person holding a licence granted
under section 7 of the Act to a particular person would be unduly
disadvantaged by the modification in competing with the holder of the
licence in which those conditions are included.




